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WAVE Hosts Virtual Activist Training featuring 
Rep. Katie Porter and Captain Mark Kelly  

 
It is Time to Take Back the White House in 2020 

 
Orange County, CA (June 17, 2020) — Women for American Values and Ethics 
Political Action Committee (WAVE PAC), along with twelve partner organizations, 
is hosting Take Back the White House 2020 on June 20th from 9:30-11:30am 
Pacific time. This virtual presentation of winning political strategies and 
techniques will be led by national organizer, Sara El-Amine. Ms. El-Amine was 
the National Grassroots Organizing Director at Organizing for Action, President 
Obama’s 20 million-person strong grassroots movement. She is known as the 
“Organizer of Organizers” for driving huge citizen-led movements for change.  
 
Partner organizations include the Democratic Party of Orange County, Laguna 
Beach Democratic Club, Indivisible OC 48, Canyon Democrats, Newport Beach 
Democratic Women’s Club, HB Huddle, Imagine Action OC, Democrats of 
Greater Irvine, Tustin Democrats, Orange County Young Democrats, Marana 
Dems and Friends, and the Laguna Woods Democratic Club. 
 
Take Back the White House 2020 aims to teach participants virtual advocacy 
methods of persuasion that can be used for all campaigns. There will also be 
special appearances by California representatives Gil Cisneros (CA-39), Katie 
Porter (CA-45), Harley Rouda (CA-48), and Mike Levin (CA-49), as well as 
prominent Arizona candidates Mark Kelly (for US Senate) and Dr. Hiral Tipirneni 
(AZ-6).  
 
WAVE’s vision is a thriving and inclusive democracy. Its mission is to engage, 
educate, and empower our community to advance progressive values and ethics. 
This year, WAVE is working towards taking back the White House and flipping 
the Senate; retaining the four Orange County congressional seats we won in 
2018; and, supporting down ballot candidates that align with our progressive 
values and ethics.  
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WAVE, with over 2,000 activists across two states, throws its considerable 
womanpower and financial weight behind those three goals. It is time to come 
together and restore experienced leadership in the White House and beyond. 
Join us on June 20th as we lay the groundwork for the battle ahead. Register now 
on our website at www.wave4all.org. 
 
About WAVE  
 
Founded in December 2016, Women for American Values and Ethics Political 
Action Committee (WAVE PAC) works to advance progressive American values 
and ethics. WAVE PAC produces significant impacts on local, state, and federal 
elections through: endorsements and vital direct contributions to campaigns up 
and down ballot; strategic communications to targeted voters using super PAC 
funds; impactful digital and print ads, as well as successful social media 
influencer campaigns; sponsored ballot parties; and member-hosted 
fundraising. For more information on WAVE PAC, visit 
www.wave4all.org/elections. 
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